
 

HOMEWORK ASSIGNMENT for ONE-IN-FAITH Gathering on Wednesday 

April 1st  

 

6:30 PM (only one session!) 

 

What are the sacraments of Holy Orders and Marriage ?  

 

 

1) The homework in the Alive in Christ workbooks (grades 1-5) is designed for you and your 

child to do together.  Please see the chart for more information about which pages you should 

complete before next class. 

 

2) The Visions homework (grades 6-8) is something your middle school student can read on 

their own, or with you.  Please choose ONE of the discussion questions in each week’s Visions 

pamphlet and discuss it with your child.   

 

3) Our next regular “classroom” session will be on Wednesday April 1st in the St. Mary’s 

School gym.  There will only be ONE session that evening, at 6:30. Please bring your child’s 

homework on this day – we will be collecting it! 

 

4) Before our next regular class on Apr 1st as part of our preparation for Easter, we will 

celebrate the sacrament of reconciliation together on Wednesday March 25th at 5:30 OR 7:30 

PM in the SMS gym.  On March 25th, we invite you to attend whichever reconciliation liturgy 

works best for your families!  

 



Faith Formation homework for 

March 4th— April 1st, 2020 

 

 Mar 4th – Mar 
11th   
 
(work on the material below with 
your child sometime during this week) 
 

Mar 11th – Mar 
18th     
 
(work on the material below with your 
child sometime during this week) 

1st grade 
 

AIC Chapter 7 Jesus the Healer 
 

AIC Chapter 8 Jesus Teaches Love 

3rd grade 
 

AIC Chapter 6 Pray Always 
 

AIC Chapter 7 The Good News 

4th grade 
 

AIC Chapter 3 God’s 
Commandments 

AIC Chapter 7 The Beatitudes 

5th grade 
 

AIC Chapter 6 A Life of Virtue 
 

AIC Chapter 7 Living Image of Christ 

6th grade 
 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 8th  Visions pamphlet for Mar 15th  

7th grade 
 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 8th  Visions pamphlet for Mar 15th  

8th grade 
 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 8th  Visions pamphlet for Mar 15th  

 



 Mar 18th – Mar 
25th  
 
(work on the material below with 
your child sometime during this week) 

 

Mar 25th – Apr 
1st   
 
(work on the material below with 
your child sometime during this week) 
 

1st grade 
 

AIC Chapter 9 Jesus Teaches Us 
to Pray 

AIC Chapter 10 Responding to 
God 

3rd grade 
 

AIC Chapter 8 The Paschal 
Mystery 

AIC Chapter 9 The Body of Christ 

4th grade 
 

AIC Chapter 8 Love God and 
Neighbor 

AIC Chapter 9 Honoring God 

5th grade 
 

AIC Chapter 8 Proclaim the 
Kingdom 

AIC Chapter 9 Celebrating the 
Paschal Mystery 

6th grade 
 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 22nd + 
TCW Sacrament of Marriage 
handout 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 29th + 
TCW Sacrament of Holy Orders 
handout 

7th grade 
 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 22nd + 
TCW Sacrament of Marriage 
handout 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 29th + 
TCW Sacrament of Holy Orders 
handout 

8th grade 
 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 22nd + 
TCW Sacrament of Marriage 
handout 

Visions pamphlet for Mar 29th + 
TCW Sacrament of Holy Orders 
handout 

 

 

 


